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Re: REFERENCE NO. PJN-2752 [INVOICE]

Dari: Pak. J. Nutr. (editorpjn@gmail.com)
Kepada: kartikarofian@yahoo.co.id
Tanggal: Kamis, 16 Januari 2014 pukul 23.46 GMT+8

Please provide us the following information to locate the amount
1. Exact date of transferring the funds

2. Name of the ordering customer [name of the person who sent the amount]

Dir. Publication

Pakistan Journal of Nutrition

Asian Network for Scientific Information,
308 - Lasani Town, Sargodha Road,
Faisalabad, Pakistan

Ph. No. 041 88 11 832

Mobile: 0345-76 85 830

E-mail: editorpjn@gmail.com
http://www.pjbs.org/pjnonline/index.htm

----- Original Message -----

From: Dewi Rofian

To: editorpjn@gmail.com

Sent: Thursday, January 16, 2014 6:51 PM

Subject: Trs: REFERENCE NO. PJN-2752 [INVOICE]

----- Pesan yang Diteruskan -----

Dari: Dewi Rofian <kartikarofian@yahoo.co.id>
Kepada: Pak. J. Nutr. <editorpjn@gmail.com>
Dikirim: Kamis, 16 Januari 2014 20:03

Judul: Bls: REFERENCE NO. PJN-2752 [INVOICE]

Dear Editor Pakistan Journal of Nutrition,

| would like to know about the progress of my paper which title: Role of Biscuits
Enriched with Albumin Protein from Snakehead Fish, Zinc and Iron on Immune
Response of Under Five Children.

| have been got the Invoice (dated: 28.10.2013) , for the Article No. PJN: 2752 (proof of
payment attached). And | have been paid amount US $ 200 in Asian Network for

Scientific Information at 30t" October 2013.
Please give me information about the progress of my paper.
Thank you for your time and help.

Yours Sincerely.
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Dewi Kartika Sari

Dari: Pak. J. Nutr. <editorpjn@gmail.com>
Kepada: kartikarofian@yahoo.co.id

Dikirim: Selasa, 29 Oktober 2013 0:57

Judul: REFERENCE NO. PJN-2752 [INVOICE]

Dear Dr. Dewi Kartika Sari

Two files are attached with this mail

In the first attachment you will find the Invoice

In the second attachment you will find the method of payment of printing charges.

To pay the printing cost through wire transfer (Tele Transfer) the necessary
information / Routing Path is given below:

Bank Name: Standard Chartered Bank (Pakistan) Limited

Address: Operations Building, I.I. Chundrigar Road, Karachi, PO Box No. 5556,
Pakistan

Swift Code: SCBLPKKX

Beneficiary's Name: Asian Network for Scientific Information
Beneficiary EBBS A/C No.: 10-1756846-01

IBAN : PK57SCBL0000010175684601

Dir. Publication

Pakistan Journal of Nutrition

Asian Network for Scientific Information,
308 - Lasani Town, Sargodha Road,
Faisalabad, Pakistan

Ph. No. 041 88 11 832

Mobile: 0345-76 85 830

E-mail: editorpjn@gmail.com
http://www.pjbs.org/pjnonline/index.htm
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