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To: sikhsan@ulm.ac.id

Dear author

Thank you for your submission. Author is requested to submit easily via electronically submission by the
(www.rjm.innspub.net or http://www.innspub.net/innspub-submission-gateway) link for auto & quick Editorial response
through author dashboard panel. Author can easily submit manuscript at next and track their paper status by the panel.
We already opened an account for you to submit a manuscript (s) and digitally quick management. Furthermore we
already have submitted that manuscript by using your email and manuscript data.

Your account details described in bellows

Login Details:

Login Link: http://rjm.innspub.net

User ID: Sadikikhsan

Password: innspub123

You con login (to INNSpub paper manager) with the details.

*I will help to publish within 7-14 days.

If you feel any difficulties then immediately contact via email (to info@innspub.net) without any hesitation.
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INNSpub Submission Support
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1 message

INNSPUB Research Manager <info@innspub.net> Tue, Nov 15, 2022 at 12:02 PM
To: Sadikikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

INNSPUB: Thank you for manuscript submission, it is queued for review

Dear Sadikikhsan,
Thank you very much for submitting your paper entitled: THE IMPACT OF
CHANGES IN PRICES AND INCOME ON DEMAND PATTERNS FOR FOOD
COMMODITIES IN BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU CITY, SOUTH
KALIMANTAN PROVINCE, INDONESIA to the International Journal of
Biosciences journal. Your paper already placed to the ‘Editor’ of desired Journal.
The respected ‘Editor’ check it immediately with consideration of journal scope &
research matters and after complete checking, it will send to the related expertise
‘Reviewer’ very soon for producing effective review and comments.

During the review and finish publication formalities, you can keep track of the
manuscript ‘status’ by accessing ‘INNSPUBs Research Manager’ panel.

Please feel free to contact us with any further questions or concerns and refer the
manuscript title for further correspondence by open a support ticket.

Once again, thank you very much for giving us the opportunity to consider your
paper.

Login Control Panel

Sincerely,
Editor in Chief
International Journal of Biosciences
Email: info@innspub.net
Website: www.innspub.net

Thanks you very much for choosing INNSPUB Network
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3 messages

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> Tue, Nov 15, 2022 at 11:51 AM
To: Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

Dear Author,

Thanks for your manuscript entitled "THE IMPACT OF CHANGES IN PRICES AND INCOME ON DEMAND
PATTERNS FOR FOOD COMMODITIES IN BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU CITY, SOUTH KALIMANTAN
PROVINCE, INDONESIA". Your manuscript ID is IJB-5260. Please mention the above manuscript ID in all future
correspondence. 

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-15 05:18, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear  Dr. Ahmad Humayan Kabir 
Editor-in-Chief of the International Journal of Biosciences
 
May I introduce myself. My name is Mr. Sadik Ikhsan. I am a lecturer in Master Study Program of Agricultural
Economy, Agriculture Faculty, Lambung Mangkurat University – Banjarbaru, Indonesia.  Hereby, I submit you a
manuscript of scientific article entitled "The Impact of Changes in Prices and Income on Demand Patterns for Food
Commodities in Banjarmasin City and Banjarbaru City, South Kalimantan Province, Indonesia" via your and official
submission email address. This article is taken from my research. I am gratefull if this article will be published as soon as
possible in the  International Journal of Biosciences.    
 
I am looking forward to your futher information about this.  Thank you
 
 
Your sincerely,
 
Sadik Ikhsan
  

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> Fri, Nov 18, 2022 at 5:32 AM
To: Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

Dear Author,

I extend my thanks for submitting your manuscript for our consideration. The manuscript has been reviewed and based
on reviewer's comments it has been decided that the paper can be accepted if revision is made point-by-point

http://innspub.net/
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https://innspub.net/editor/dr-ahmad-humayan-kabir/
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according to the reviewer's comments. Please mark the changes in RED.

                                                                                                                

We are always keen to publish your paper as soon as possible. However, due to a large number of submissions, we
cordially request you to send the revised version. This will give us sufficient time for processing of paper and other
formalities for the coming issue.

Special instruction:

1. i) Please delete the comments made on the right side of the manuscript and send us a fresh copy.

Always mention the manuscript number email.

                                                        

Author instruction:

http://www.innspub.net/instruction-for-international-journal-of-biosciences/

Sample paper:

http://www.innspub.net/category/current-issue-ijb/

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

[Quoted text hidden]
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Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id> Sat, Nov 26, 2022 at 7:14 AM
To: "International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)" <ijb@innspub.net>

Dear  Dr. Ahmad Kabir
Editor in Chief International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

Manuscript ID: IJB-5260
I have revised my manuscript IJB-5260 following reviewer's comments.  Now I resend it to you. Please
check in attachment. Hopely it will be publish as soon as possible in IJB. Thanks

Yours sincerely,
Sadik Ikhsan
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Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

IJB-5260
3 messages

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> Sat, Nov 26, 2022 at 7:33 AM
To: Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

Dear Author,

Your paper entitled “THE IMPACT OF CHANGES IN PRICES AND INCOME ON DEMAND PATTERNS FOR FOOD
COMMODITIES IN BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU CITY, SOUTH KALIMANTAN PROVINCE,
INDONESIA” has been accepted to the International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) and payment for further processing
of the paper is requested. Thanks for your contribution.

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-26 05:14, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear  Dr. Ahmad Kabir
Editor in Chief International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)
 

Manuscript ID: IJB-5260
 
I have revised my manuscript IJB-5260 following reviewer's comments.  Now I resend it to you.
Please check in attachment. Hopely it will be publish as soon as possible in IJB. Thanks
 
Yours sincerely,
Sadik Ikhsan

On Fri, Nov 18, 2022 at 5:32 AM International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> wrote:

Dear Author,

I extend my thanks for submitting your manuscript for our consideration. The manuscript has been reviewed and
based on reviewer's comments it has been decided that the paper can be accepted if revision is made point-by-
point according to the reviewer's comments. Please mark the changes in RED.

                                                                                                                

We are always keen to publish your paper as soon as possible. However, due to a large number of submissions,
we cordially request you to send the revised version. This will give us sufficient time for processing of paper and
other formalities for the coming issue.
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Special instruction:

1. i) Please delete the comments made on the right side of the manuscript and send us a fresh
copy.

Always mention the manuscript number email.

                                                        

Author instruction:

http://www.innspub.net/instruction-for-international-journal-of-biosciences/

Sample paper:

http://www.innspub.net/category/current-issue-ijb/

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-15 09:51, International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) wrote:

Dear Author,

Thanks for your manuscript entitled "THE IMPACT OF CHANGES IN PRICES AND INCOME ON DEMAND
PATTERNS FOR FOOD COMMODITIES IN BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU CITY, SOUTH
KALIMANTAN PROVINCE, INDONESIA". Your manuscript ID is IJB-5260. Please mention the above
manuscript ID in all future correspondence. 

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-15 05:18, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear  Dr. Ahmad Humayan Kabir 
Editor-in-Chief of the International Journal of Biosciences
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May I introduce myself. My name is Mr. Sadik Ikhsan. I am a lecturer in Master Study Program of Agricultural
Economy, Agriculture Faculty, Lambung Mangkurat University – Banjarbaru, Indonesia.  Hereby, I submit you
a manuscript of scientific article entitled "The Impact of Changes in Prices and Income on Demand Patterns
for Food Commodities in Banjarmasin City and Banjarbaru City, South Kalimantan Province, Indonesia" via
your and official submission email address. This article is taken from my research. I am gratefull if this article will be
published as soon as possible in the  International Journal of Biosciences.    
 
I am looking forward to your futher information about this.  Thank you
 
 
Your sincerely,
 
Sadik Ikhsan
  

IJB-5260-Invoice.pdf
183K

Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id> Tue, Nov 29, 2022 at 8:59 PM
To: "International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)" <ijb@innspub.net>

Dear Dr. Ahmad Kabir  
I am very glad receiving your email telling me that my paper entitled “THE IMPACT OF CHANGES
IN PRICES AND INCOME ON DEMAND PATTERNS FOR FOOD COMMODITIES IN
BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU CITY, SOUTH KALIMANTAN PROVINCE,
INDONESIA” has been accepted to publish in the IJB.  On Sunday, November 28, 2022  I have
sent you a payment. It must be USD 120 as your request, however there was a mistake in Kantor
Pos Indonesia which was only USD 110 sent.  So I sent you another payment as much as USD
10.  Please check a copy of Western Union Sending Receipt in attachment. Thanks you.
 
Best wishes,
Sadik Ikhsan

[Quoted text hidden]

2022_11_28 Receipt.pdf
228K

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> Tue, Nov 29, 2022 at 10:07 PM
To: Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

Dear Author,

Thanks for the payment. Please note that we do not send galley proof. If you need to correct anything, please send the
final revised version within 72 hours. However, you cannot add any extra authors in this final version. Now your paper
will be sent for editing and we will get back to you with the published version. Until then, please be patience!

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=0b99209784&view=att&th=184b1238186f09e4&attid=0.1&disp=attd&safe=1&zw
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Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

Re: IJB-5260 (problem in payment)
4 messages

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> Wed, Nov 30, 2022 at 5:19 AM
To: Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

 Dear Author,

I could not collect the money because your agent did you mention the name of state. The state is Georgia and the
country is United States of America. Please do the correction with your agent and send me the new receipt.

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-29 18:59, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear Dr. Ahmad Kabir  
I am very glad receiving your email telling me that my paper entitled "THE IMPACT OF
CHANGES IN PRICES AND INCOME ON DEMAND PATTERNS FOR FOOD COMMODITIES
IN BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU CITY, SOUTH KALIMANTAN PROVINCE,
INDONESIA" has been accepted to publish in the IJB.  On Sunday, November 28, 2022  I have
sent you a payment. It must be USD 120 as your request, however there was a mistake in
Kantor Pos Indonesia which was only USD 110 sent.  So I sent you another payment as much as
USD 10.  Please check a copy of Western Union Sending Receipt in attachment. Thanks you.
 
Best wishes,
Sadik Ikhsan
 

On Sat, Nov 26, 2022 at 7:33 AM International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> wrote:

Dear Author,

Your paper entitled "THE IMPACT OF CHANGES IN PRICES AND INCOME ON DEMAND PATTERNS FOR
FOOD COMMODITIES IN BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU CITY, SOUTH KALIMANTAN PROVINCE,
INDONESIA" has been accepted to the International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) and payment for further
processing of the paper is requested. Thanks for your contribution.

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

http://innspub.net/
http://facebook.com/innspub
mailto:ijb@innspub.net
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Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-26 05:14, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear  Dr. Ahmad Kabir
Editor in Chief International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)
 

Manuscript ID: IJB-5260
 
I have revised my manuscript IJB-5260 following reviewer's comments.  Now I resend it to you.
Please check in attachment. Hopely it will be publish as soon as possible in IJB. Thanks
 
Yours sincerely,
Sadik Ikhsan

On Fri, Nov 18, 2022 at 5:32 AM International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> wrote:

Dear Author,

I extend my thanks for submitting your manuscript for our consideration. The manuscript has been reviewed
and based on reviewer's comments it has been decided that the paper can be accepted if revision is made
point-by-point according to the reviewer's comments. Please mark the changes in RED.

                                                                                                                

We are always keen to publish your paper as soon as possible. However, due to a large number of
submissions, we cordially request you to send the revised version. This will give us sufficient time for
processing of paper and other formalities for the coming issue.

Special instruction:

1. i) Please delete the comments made on the right side of the manuscript and send us a
fresh copy.

Always mention the manuscript number email.

                                                        

Author instruction:

http://www.innspub.net/instruction-for-international-journal-of-biosciences/

Sample paper:

http://www.innspub.net/category/current-issue-ijb/

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

http://innspub.net/
http://facebook.com/innspub
mailto:ijb@innspub.net
http://www.innspub.net/instruction-for-international-journal-of-biosciences/
http://www.innspub.net/category/current-issue-ijb/
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Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-15 09:51, International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) wrote:

Dear Author,

Thanks for your manuscript entitled "THE IMPACT OF CHANGES IN PRICES AND INCOME ON DEMAND
PATTERNS FOR FOOD COMMODITIES IN BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU CITY, SOUTH
KALIMANTAN PROVINCE, INDONESIA". Your manuscript ID is IJB-5260. Please mention the above
manuscript ID in all future correspondence. 

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-15 05:18, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear  Dr. Ahmad Humayan Kabir 
Editor-in-Chief of the International Journal of Biosciences
 
May I introduce myself. My name is Mr. Sadik Ikhsan. I am a lecturer in Master Study Program of
Agricultural Economy, Agriculture Faculty, Lambung Mangkurat University – Banjarbaru, Indonesia. 
Hereby, I submit you a manuscript of scientific article entitled "The Impact of Changes in Prices and
Income on Demand Patterns for Food Commodities in Banjarmasin City and Banjarbaru City, South
Kalimantan Province, Indonesia" via your and official submission email address. This article is taken from my
research. I am gratefull if this article will be published as soon as possible in the  International Journal of
Biosciences.    
 
I am looking forward to your futher information about this.  Thank you
 
 
Your sincerely,
 
Sadik Ikhsan
  

Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id> Wed, Dec 7, 2022 at 7:46 AM
To: "International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)" <ijb@innspub.net>

Dear Dr. Ahmad Humayan Kabir
Editor in Chief International Journal of Biosciences

Manuscript ID:  IJB-5260

http://innspub.net/
http://facebook.com/innspub
http://innspub.net/
http://facebook.com/innspub
https://innspub.net/editor/dr-ahmad-humayan-kabir/
https://innspub.net/editor/dr-ahmad-humayan-kabir/
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There might be a misunderstanding about how to collect money that I sent to you. According to my agent
(Kantor POS Indonesia) the money is in the status of “will call” meaning ready to collect. You just come to
the nearest Western Union with ID card and tell them the number of MTCN which is 266-775-1343 and
366-624-6130 then they will pay you money USD 110.- and USD 10.-.  May you to do it as my agent’s
suggestion. However if you still have the problem about this, please let me know another your bank
account. I will do bank transfer to send money payment of my article publication through that bank
account. Thanks

Your sincerely,

Sadik Ikhsan

[Quoted text hidden]

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> Thu, Dec 8, 2022 at 1:58 AM
To: Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

I have been collecting money for long. The online status would always say "ready for pick up" but in reality the US
state should mentioned in the transaction. Yes, you cancel the payment from your end and make a new transaction
following the instruction. If you have PayPal, do let me know.

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

[Quoted text hidden]

Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id> Thu, Dec 8, 2022 at 5:54 PM
To: "International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)" <ijb@innspub.net>

Dear Dr. Ahmad Humayan Kabir
Editor in Chief International Journal of Biosciences

Manuscript ID:  IJB-5260

I have cancelled the payment through the WU and now will make a new transaction. Would you please to
make the new invoice for me to transfer payment through PayPal. Hopely it will work.  Thanks you. 

Your sincerely,

Sadik Ikhsan
[Quoted text hidden]
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Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

Re: IJB-5260 (new invoice)
3 messages

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> Thu, Dec 8, 2022 at 10:32 PM
To: Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

Please find the attachment for the new invoice.

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-12-08 15:54, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear Dr. Ahmad Humayan Kabir
Editor in Chief International Journal of Biosciences
 
Manuscript ID:  IJB-5260

I have cancelled the payment through the WU and now will make a new transaction. Would you please to
make the new invoice for me to transfer payment through PayPal. Hopely it will work.  Thanks you. 
 
Your sincerely,
 
Sadik Ikhsan

On Thu, Dec 8, 2022 at 1:58 AM International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> wrote:

I have been collecting money for long. The online status would always say "ready for pick up" but in reality the US
state should mentioned in the transaction. Yes, you cancel the payment from your end and make a new
transaction following the instruction. If you have PayPal, do let me know.

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub
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On 2022-12-07 05:46, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear Dr. Ahmad Humayan Kabir
Editor in Chief International Journal of Biosciences
 
Manuscript ID:  IJB-5260
 
There might be a misunderstanding about how to collect money that I sent to you. According to
my agent (Kantor POS Indonesia) the money is in the status of "will call" meaning ready to
collect. You just come to the nearest Western Union with ID card and tell them the number of
MTCN which is 266-775-1343 and 366-624-6130 then they will pay you money USD 110.- and
USD 10.-.  May you to do it as my agent's suggestion. However if you still have the problem
about this, please let me know another your bank account. I will do bank transfer to send money
payment of my article publication through that bank account. Thanks
 
Your sincerely,
 
Sadik Ikhsan
 

On Wed, Nov 30, 2022 at 5:19 AM International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> wrote:

 Dear Author,

I could not collect the money because your agent did you mention the name of state. The state is Georgia and
the country is United States of America. Please do the correction with your agent and send me the new
receipt.

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-29 18:59, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear Dr. Ahmad Kabir  
I am very glad receiving your email telling me that my paper entitled "THE IMPACT OF
CHANGES IN PRICES AND INCOME ON DEMAND PATTERNS FOR FOOD
COMMODITIES IN BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU CITY, SOUTH
KALIMANTAN PROVINCE, INDONESIA" has been accepted to publish in the IJB.  On
Sunday, November 28, 2022  I have sent you a payment. It must be USD 120 as your
request, however there was a mistake in Kantor Pos Indonesia which was only USD 110
sent.  So I sent you another payment as much as USD 10.  Please check a copy of
Western Union Sending Receipt in attachment. Thanks you.
 
Best wishes,
Sadik Ikhsan
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On Sat, Nov 26, 2022 at 7:33 AM International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> wrote:

Dear Author,

Your paper entitled "THE IMPACT OF CHANGES IN PRICES AND INCOME ON DEMAND PATTERNS
FOR FOOD COMMODITIES IN BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU CITY, SOUTH KALIMANTAN
PROVINCE, INDONESIA" has been accepted to the International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) and
payment for further processing of the paper is requested. Thanks for your contribution.

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-26 05:14, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear  Dr. Ahmad Kabir
Editor in Chief International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)
 

Manuscript ID: IJB-5260
 
I have revised my manuscript IJB-5260 following reviewer's comments.  Now I resend it
to you. Please check in attachment. Hopely it will be publish as soon as possible in IJB.
Thanks
 
Yours sincerely,
Sadik Ikhsan

On Fri, Nov 18, 2022 at 5:32 AM International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> wrote:

Dear Author,

I extend my thanks for submitting your manuscript for our consideration. The manuscript has been
reviewed and based on reviewer's comments it has been decided that the paper can be accepted if
revision is made point-by-point according to the reviewer's comments. Please mark the changes in
RED.

                                                                                                                

We are always keen to publish your paper as soon as possible. However, due to a large number of
submissions, we cordially request you to send the revised version. This will give us sufficient time for
processing of paper and other formalities for the coming issue.

Special instruction:

1. i) Please delete the comments made on the right side of the manuscript and send
us a fresh copy.

Always mention the manuscript number email.

                                                        

mailto:ijb@innspub.net
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Author instruction:

http://www.innspub.net/instruction-for-international-journal-of-biosciences/

Sample paper:

http://www.innspub.net/category/current-issue-ijb/

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-15 09:51, International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) wrote:

Dear Author,

Thanks for your manuscript entitled "THE IMPACT OF CHANGES IN PRICES AND INCOME ON
DEMAND PATTERNS FOR FOOD COMMODITIES IN BANJARMASIN CITY AND BANJARBARU
CITY, SOUTH KALIMANTAN PROVINCE, INDONESIA". Your manuscript ID is IJB-5260. Please
mention the above manuscript ID in all future correspondence. 

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

On 2022-11-15 05:18, Sadik Ikhsan wrote:

Dear  Dr. Ahmad Humayan Kabir 
Editor-in-Chief of the International Journal of Biosciences
 
May I introduce myself. My name is Mr. Sadik Ikhsan. I am a lecturer in Master Study Program of
Agricultural Economy, Agriculture Faculty, Lambung Mangkurat University – Banjarbaru,
Indonesia.  Hereby, I submit you a manuscript of scientific article entitled "The Impact of
Changes in Prices and Income on Demand Patterns for Food Commodities in Banjarmasin City
and Banjarbaru City, South Kalimantan Province, Indonesia" via your and official submission email
address. This article is taken from my research. I am gratefull if this article will be published as soon
as possible in the  International Journal of Biosciences.    
 
I am looking forward to your futher information about this.  Thank you
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Your sincerely,
 
Sadik Ikhsan
  

IJB-5260-Invoice.pdf
139K

Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id> Thu, Dec 15, 2022 at 8:33 AM
To: "International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)" <ijb@innspub.net>

Dear Dr. Ahmad Humayan Kabir
Editor in Chief International Journal of Biosciences
 

Manuscript ID:  IJB-5260
 
 
 
My brother Dr. Fadly H. Yusran fhyusran@ulm.ac.id just helped me to make payment USD 120 for
manuscript IJB-5260 through his PayPal to Md Mazedul Islam PayPal account.  Please find attachment for
details.     The payment has been done.   Would like you to inform me when the manuscript will be
published? Thanks.

Your sincerely,
Sadik Ikhsan

[Quoted text hidden]

Universitas Lambung Mangkurat Mail - FW_ You sent a payment.pdf
224K

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> Thu, Dec 15, 2022 at 12:00 PM
To: Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

We got it, Thanks.

---

Sincerely,

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia)

Editor in Chief

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB)

web: http://innspub.net

http://facebook.com/innspub

[Quoted text hidden]
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Sadik Ikhsan <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

Congratulations! Your fruitful manuscript has been published
1 message

INNSpub Network <info@innspub.net> Mon, Dec 26, 2022 at 2:31 PM
To: Author <sikhsan@ulm.ac.id>

Dear Author(s): Sadik Ikhsan, Djoko Santoso, Febriyanti Puteri Lestari, Agung Dewi Permatasari
Congratulations! We are happy to inform you that, your submitted paper entitled: 'The impact of changes in prices and
income on demand patterns for food commodities in Banjarmasin City and Banjarbaru City, South Kalimantan
Province, Indonesia' has been published in the "International Journal of Biosciences" Journal. You can take
advantage of the published paper for valid reference or scientific purpose and can share in global scientific community,
social media & library.

Here some necessary document links for the published paper below:
Published paper link: https://innspub.net/the-impact-of-changes-in-prices-and-income-on-demand-patterns-for-food-
commodities-in-banjarmasin-city-and-banjarbaru-city-south-kalimantan-province-indonesia/
Cover page link: Create cover and Download
Certificate for the publication link: Create certificate and Download

The published paper will be available forever in the archive of the International Journal of Biosciences journal of
'International Network for Natural Sciences website. INNSpub store it as an effective research findings and publications
for the mankind.

Thank you very much for choosing and being with the INNSpub publication Network.

Regards,
International Network for Natural Sciences
Website: www.innspub.net
Email: info@innspub.net
Online Submission: www.rjm.innspub.net

https://innspub.net/the-impact-of-changes-in-prices-and-income-on-demand-patterns-for-food-commodities-in-banjarmasin-city-and-banjarbaru-city-south-kalimantan-province-indonesia/
http://www.innspub.net/cover/?target=30889
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