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Compose
Mail On Mon, Jan 30, 2023 at 7:57 PM Technium Editor <editor@techniumscience.com> wrote:
Inbox 1441 Ahmad Amin:
chat Starred We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Technium: Romanian Journal of Applied Sciences an
Snoozed CONSTRUCTION OF SYAMSUDDIN NOOR AIRPORT SOUTH KALIMANTAN PROVINCIAL GOVERNMENT (
Spaces Sent Our decision is to: Accept Submission
Drafts 1 You can pay by card: https:/buy.stripe.com/9AQfZRbn19m03zGdQQ
Meet More
For payment use the following options:
Labels 1. You can pay the publishing fee using the Paypal invoice already provided.

https://www.paypal.com/invoice/p/#TMAMQSFKXFWQZNIQ

2. You can with Bank transfer:
Bank transfer payment details: Article 1D 8422

IBAN: RO70INGB0000999912711113

Beneficiary name: Scurtu lonut-Cristian PFA

Beneficiary address: Str Soveja, Nr 110, Constanta, Romania, European Unionn
Beneficiary bank: ING BANK

Bank address: Bloc B6, Parter, Unitatea 22, Strada Cismelei, Constanta 900001
SWIFT Code: INGBROBU or INGBROBUXXX

Amount: 150 Euro (DOl included)

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/1/?ogblsearch/amin/FMfcgzGrcrptmTgLpbrRdhwKsPcsKnfm 11



