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We hereby submit the manuscript of the journal.
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Dear Author,

Your Article has been received. The Paper has been forwarded to the review
process. Soon you will be communicating with review report details. Your article
id: CE23MAYO007
Thanking You and Best Regards,

Editorial Team SSRG-IJCE
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Thank you for your response.
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18,
7:22 PM

to me

Dear Sir/Madam,

Your paper review process has been completed and it cannot be considered for
the publication. If you want, you can revise your paper with the said modifications below
and send your modified paper along with a plagiarism report.

*Include a literature review section, which gives some ideas about existing work
to readers.

* Draw the table in MS Word itself on your own.

* Draw the possible diagrams in MS word and make it beautiful with coloring and
legibility.

* |If the diagram is big , place it in a single column.

* Use High clarity images. Diagram information should be clearly visible to
readers.

* Authors must check the English language carefully. No Al generated or
ChatGPT generated terms are permitted.

* Strictly prepare your references as per journal format.
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Muhammad Arsyad <emarsyad@ulm.ac.id> May 23,
2023,
6:53 PM
to IJCE
Dear Sir,

- Repairs have been made according to the directions, attached;
- Plagiarism test, attached.

Thank You,

Arsyad
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Dear Sir/Ma’am,

We are delighted to inform you that your manuscript
"ID: CE23MAYO007, Title: Road Pavement Damage Caused By Traffic

Segment: Road of Governor Soebardjo has been ”Accepted for
Publication” in SSRG-International Journal of Civil
Engineering (SSRG-IJCE)", ISSN: 2348-8352.

Please see the attached reviewer comments for further details about necessary
revisions.

Registration Process
Article Processing Charges:
$467 / 467€: Online Publication Only [Mandatory]

Note: Author count cannot be added once the paper gets accepted.

Kindly try to pay the Article Processing Charges within 4 working days.

Authors can use any one of the following payment options:
1.You can use your debit card/credit card to pay the publication fee through
PayPal, from our website Payment Gateway.

https://www.internationaljournalssrg.org/IJCE/mode-of-payment.html

2. Account Details for Bank / Wire Transfer:

Account Holder Name: Surendiran.R

Address of A/c Holder: [ G6 Park Plus Apartment, Muthaiya Nagar, Mutharasanallur, Trichy, 620101.

Account Number: 50100120640677



https://www.internationaljournalssrg.org/IJCE/mode-of-payment.html

Bank Name: HDEFC Bank

Branch Address: 11th cross, Thillai Nagar main Road, Trichy-620018, Tamilnadu, India.
IFSC Code: HDFC0000058

Swift Code: HDFCINBB

(If there is any problem while making the payment
process, please feel free to contact us with any
questions. we will assist you)

Final Documents to reach us:

1) Revised Final Paper for publication as per our updated SSRG-IJCE
template.

(Link of our Paper Template and Copyright

from: https://www.internationaljournalssrg.org/IJCE/index.html )
2) Scanned copy of your bank payment receipt (write your name on top
of the receipt), if done by online payment, send us the transaction id;
date; account holder name, and account number.
3) Signed Copyrights form for your article. You can either place a digital
signature in the word file or take a printout; fill the entries then scan and

send it to us.

Note: To avoid a last-minute rush, Submit the final paper, copyright form,
and payment proof as soon as possible to get an early publication.

Thank you for your association with SSRG-IJCE and we hope to see more of
your work in the future.

Best Regards,

Editorial Support Team
https://www.internationaljournalssrg.org/I[JCE/index.html
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Dear,
Please provide information regarding the publication of my journal.

Thank You

On Fri, May 26, 2023 at 6:37 PM IJCE Journal <ijce@internationaljournalssrg.org> wrote:

Dear sir/mam,

Final Documents and payment has been received. soon your article will get published. you will
receive an acknowledgment mail after publication.

Thanking you.
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Dear sir/fmam,
Greetings from SSRG International Journal of Civil Engineering!!!
Your Paper ID: 1JCE-V10I15P104
Your paper has been published in Volume 10 Issue 5 May 2023 issue.
Kindly check it on our website.
Kindly upload your published SSRG-IJCE PDF format article in Google Scholar profile,
Cornell university arXiv library, ResearchGate profile, and Academia.edu profile as this will

improve the searchability and impact factor of articles.

Thanking you.



