
11/7/22, 1:45 PM Universitas Lambung Mangkurat Mail - Issue 23-1781 (R1)

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=df488753f0&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1677618116805492163&simpl=msg-f%3A16776181… 1/5

Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Issue 23-1781 (R1)

16 messages

Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com> Sat, Sep 12, 2020 at 5:01 PM
To: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Dear Authors, 
Please revise carefully your article before publishing, remove all colours from the text; there
are
many reference not included in the text
Please, send the fee of publication
($100) by Western Union to: 
First name: Magdy Tawfik 
Last name: Khalil Ibrahim 
 The full name should be written: Magdy Tawfik Khalil
Ibrahim 
Cairo, Egypt 
Tel. 01006526185 

Regards  

From: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Sent: Monday, September 7, 2020 9:52 AM

To: mtkhalil52@hotmail.com <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Subject: Minor Revision Manuscript #EJABF-2007-1781 (R1)
 
Dear editor,

We have revised the manuscript following the reviewer's suggestions. Revisions are marked with text/sentences
highlighted in yellow. We attach a revised manuscript. Thank you for your kindness.


Regards,

Heri Budi Santoso


Issue 23-1781.doc

1486K

Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id> Wed, Sep 16, 2020 at 2:51 PM
To: Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Dear Magdy Khalil,
 
I have revised the manuscript according to your suggestions.(issue 23-1781 (R1).  I have sent the fee of publication
($ 100) by Western Union with MTCN 413-804-2605. Thank you.

Regards
[Quoted text hidden]

Western Union Magdy Tawfik from Heri Budi Santoso.jpg
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Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id> Thu, Sep 17, 2020 at 6:03 AM
To: Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Dear Magdy Khalil,
I have revised the manuscript according to your suggestions.(issue 23-1781 (R1).  I have sent the fee of publication
($ 100) by Western Union with MTCN 413-804-2605. Thank you.

Regards  


On Sat, Sep 12, 2020 at 4:01 PM Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments
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EJABF-Templat (R2).doc

1539K

Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com> Thu, Sep 17, 2020 at 2:29 PM
To: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Where is the revised article?

From: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Sent: Wednesday, September 16, 2020 6:51 AM

To: Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Subject: Re: Issue 23-1781 (R1)
 
[Quoted text hidden]

Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id> Thu, Sep 17, 2020 at 4:03 PM
To: Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Dear Magdy Khalil,
I have revised the manuscript according to your suggestions.(issue 23-1781 (R1).  I have sent the fee of publication
($ 100) by Western Union with MTCN 413-804-2605. Thank you.

Regards  

[Quoted text hidden]
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1539K

Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id> Mon, Sep 21, 2020 at 9:47 AM
To: Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Dear Magdy Khalil
I have received an email from the EJABF editor that the manuscript (issue 23-1781) is declared accepted (scientific). I
was instructed by the editor to send you the revised manuscript. Attached is the notification of manuscripts that have
been received and manuscripts that have been revised following the recommendations of the reviewers. Thank you.


Regards
[Quoted text hidden]

2 attachments

EJABF Acceptance.JPG

75K

EJABF-Templat (R2) issue 23-1781 R1.doc

1539K

Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com> Mon, Sep 21, 2020 at 3:17 PM
To: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

No Sir, this is not the last version we sent to you for revising....the
last one has the pages numbers, and revised for English and
references....we will not proceed publishing till you revised the last
version


Regards

From: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Sent: Monday, September 21, 2020 1:47 AM
[Quoted text hidden]
 
[Quoted text hidden]

Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com> Tue, Sep 22, 2020 at 2:11 AM
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To: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

 No...this is not the last version......the last one has the number of
pages and dates....please revise the last one and send it

From: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Sent: Thursday, September 17, 2020 8:03 AM
[Quoted text hidden]
 
[Quoted text hidden]

Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id> Tue, Sep 22, 2020 at 8:59 AM
To: Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Yes Sir, Would you please give me instructions on how to write the number of page and date. Thank you.

Regards
[Quoted text hidden]

Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id> Tue, Sep 22, 2020 at 10:44 AM
To: Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Yes Sir. I have sent you a revised article according to your suggestions. Thank you

Regards

On Tue, Sep 22, 2020 at 1:11 AM Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com> wrote:

[Quoted text hidden]

EJABF-Templat (R2).doc

1539K

Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com> Tue, Sep 22, 2020 at 5:03 PM
To: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

No , I sent you this attached version to revise

From: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Sent: Tuesday, September 22, 2020 2:44 AM
[Quoted text hidden]
 
[Quoted text hidden]

Issue 23-1781ffff.doc

1486K

Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id> Tue, Sep 22, 2020 at 8:48 PM
To: Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Yes, Sir. I have revised the article that you have submitted to me. Thank you


Regards
[Quoted text hidden]
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Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com> Tue, Sep 22, 2020 at 11:51 PM
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To: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

OK...we are waiting till paying the fee of publishing


From: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Sent: Tuesday, September 22, 2020 12:48 PM
[Quoted text hidden]
 
[Quoted text hidden]

Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id> Wed, Sep 23, 2020 at 12:10 AM
To: Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Yes sir. I have sent the publication fee on September 16, 2020 with western uniorn. MTCN 413 804 2605.

Regards

[Quoted text hidden]
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Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com> Wed, Sep 23, 2020 at 1:13 AM
To: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Dear Authors, 
Congratulations….Your article has been published on the Website of the Journal. 
Regards 

From: Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id>

Sent: Tuesday, September 22, 2020 12:48 PM

[Quoted text hidden]
 
[Quoted text hidden]

Heri Budi Santoso <heribudisantoso@ulm.ac.id> Wed, Sep 23, 2020 at 4:03 PM
To: Magdy Khalil <mtkhalil52@hotmail.com>

Yes Sir. Thank you.
Regards
[Quoted text hidden]
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