On Sat, Dec 10, 2022 at 11:48 AM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear Dr. Arnida Arnida,

Thank you very much for your submission to the Pharmacognosy Journal. We have received your article entitled
"PHARMACOGNOSTIC CHARACTERISTICS AND ANTIOXIDANT ACTIVITY OF GENDOLA STEM (Basella rubra L.)
ETHANOL EXTRACT FROM SOUTH KALIMANTAN?”. The article is now under our PRELIMINARY EVALUATION and we
will keep you updated on the article status accordingly.

As we are an open-access non-profit organization, we require publication charges to recover our editorial and production expenses.
They cover the range of publishing services we provide which includes the provision of online tools for editors and authors, article
production and hosting, liaison with abstracting and indexing services, and customer services. The publication charges are 1249
GBP for the accepted article. You are required to process publication charges upon acceptance of your article (after peer-review).
Kindly confirm your response to proceed with the review process.

‘We thank you for submitting your valuable work to the Pharmacognosy Journal.
Kindly get back to us for further queries.

Have a great day.!

Best regards,

Emily Flora
Managing Editor

On Tue, Dec 13, 2022 at 3:12 AM ARNIDA ARNIDA <arnida01@ulm.ac.id> wrote:
Thank you for the response from the editor of the journal Pharmaconosy.
may i apply for a waiver/discount to pay this fee 500GBP
| hope wisdom from pharmacognosy journals

Besgt regar

Arnida

On Mon, Dec 19, 2022 at 3:15 PM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear ARNIDA,

Thanks for your email. We accept your request. Soon, we will get back to you with the review comments.
Regards,
Emily Flora
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Manuscript Accepted for Publication-PJ-22-1065 (Extemal Inbox x =)
Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> Mon, Jan9, 113PM ¢ €
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Arnida Arnida:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Pharmacognosy Journal, "Gondola PHARMACOGNOSTIC
CHARACTERISTICS AND ANTIOXIDANT ACTIVITY OF GENDOLA STEM (Basella rubra L.) ETHANOL EXTRACT FROM
SOUTH KALIMANTAN".

Our decision is to: Accept Submission

I truly appreciate all your hard work, dedication and commitments towards this work. This paper is well described clearly and it is
accepted to publish without any revisions.

Awaiting your response.

Regards,
Emily Flora

On Mon, Dec 19, 2022 at 3:15 PM Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear ARNIDA,

Thanks for your email. We accept your request. Soon, we will get back to you with the review comments.
Regards,
Emily Flora

Pharmacognosy Journal <editor.phcogi@gmail.com> @ Mar9,2023,1249PM Yy “

tome v

Dear ARNIDA,

>

@

Thanks for your response. We have already sent the wire transfer invoice on Feb 14th, 2023. For your reference, we are attaching again. Kindly make the payment and send

us the receipt at the earliest.
Regards,
Emily Flora

One attachment + Scanned by Gmail ®

B8 PJ-22-1065 Wire T... y
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Dear ARNIDA,

Please find the attached galley proof. Let me know if any changes are needed within 48hrs.
Regards,
Emily Flora

One attachment + Scanned by Gmail ®
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Regards,

Arnida
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Dear ARNIDA,
Thanks for your email. Your article will be published in Volume 15 Issue 2 by the end of this month.

Regards,
Emily Flora



