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U. Fitriati <ufitriati@ulm.ac.id>

JAEBS-2108-11
U. Fitriati <ufitriati@unlam.ac.id> Mon, Feb 13, 2017 at 4:53 PM
To: Textroad Journals <textroadjournals@gmail.com>

Dear editor, 
JAEBS-2018-11, ULFA FITRIATI, INDONESIA. Have been pay by western union no MTCN : 306-580-1694. 
Thank you

Pada tanggal 11 Feb 2017 9:06 PM, "Textroad Journals" <textroadjournals@gmail.com> menulis:

Dear Colleague,

Your manuscript has been reviewed and accepted for publication. Subsequent evaluations regarding your manuscript will be
sent along with the galley proof, if the need arises.

 

Kindly, pay your charges ($ 150) to move to the next step of publication.

Deposit the manuscript handling charges to our representative of Middle East account as follows:

 

Bank Name Al Rajhi Bank

Swift code RJHISARI

Bank address Riyadh, Saudi Arabia

Account No. 185608010154828

IBAN SA8180000185608010154828

Account Holder (Beneficiary Name) Mounir M.Bekhet

Account Holder (Beneficiary address) Riyadh, KSA.

 

OR:

 

Western Union:

Full Name: Mounir Mohamed Mohamed Bekhet

(Please be sure to write the full name of receiver in your receipt)

 

Address: Riyadh, P.O. Box 2457, Riyadh 11451, KSA (Kingdom of Saudi Arabia).

 

- Kindly, write the number of your paper on your receipt and you should include the sender name in your receipt (the one who
transferred money to the bank)

- Please be advised that no proofs will be sent to you for correction and under no circumstances any further changes will be
accepted on your article after publishing.

 

Please send the copyrights form and manuscript handling charges details as soon as possible.

 

mailto:textroadjournals@gmail.com
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NB: If you have more than one paper, Kindly pay all your fees in one receipt.

 

Thank you

Best Regards

 

Accounts Unit,

 

TextRoad Journals,

textroadjournals@gmail.com.

On Fri, Feb 10, 2017 at 2:21 PM, Textroad Journals <textroadjournals@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Colleague,

Thank you for your response to our Email. We acknowledge the receipt of your revised manuscript and will inform you of the
reviewers’ decision concerning the acceptance or rejection of your manuscript soon.

Best regards

Textroad Editorial Team

http:// www.textroad.com

On Fri, Feb 10, 2017 at 9:17 AM, U. Fitriati <ufitriati@unlam.ac.id> wrote:
Dear Editor.
Greeting and Best wishes.
This manuscript has been revised, thank you for the evaluation

On Thu, Dec 8, 2016 at 2:12 AM, Textroad Journals <textroadjournals@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear colleague,

 
Please find attached the reviewers’ evaluations for your submitted manuscript 
Kindly effect the recommended corrections and send it back to me as soon as possible. Please write out your
responses for each of the points raised by the reviewer or the step by step actions taken. You may also highlight
where you effected the corrections on your revised manuscript. Subsequent evaluations may be sent to you if the
need arises.

NOTE: Kindly indicate with red text color in the revised manuscript for old changes while new changes should
involve another text color in other to avoid confusion. Remove irrelevant or deleted words from the revised
manuscript before you proceed for re-submission.

Best regards

 

Textroad Editorial Team

TextRoad Journals
E-mail: textroadjournals@gmail.com
http:// www.textroad.com

On Wed, Nov 9, 2016 at 10:42 PM, Textroad Journals <textroadjournals@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Ulfa Fitriati,

Thank you for submitting your valuable manuscript to Journal of Applied Environmental and
Biological Sciences (JAEBS) (ISI indexed).

 

Manuscript details are provided below:

mailto:textroadjournals@gmail.com
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Manuscript title: EFFECT OF CANAL BLOCKING TO
PEATLAND WATER CONTENT IN WETLANDS
AREAS OF SUNGAI AHAS EXS PLG CENTRAL
KALIMANTAN

Manuscript No.: JAEBS-2108-11

Received Date: November 9 2016

Corresponding author: Ulfa Fitriati

Manuscript type: Full paper

 

Please refer this No. in all further communications about this manuscript.

 

We will now proceed with your manuscript for ACCELERATED review as
requested and then revert to you on the outcome, hopefully, within 2
weeks to a month. If your manuscript is accepted for publication, you will be
required to pay an accelerated publication charge of US$150. In all enquiries, quote your
manuscript no.

The manuscript is already in review process.

 

Best regards

Robert Akpoiduo

TextRoad Journals
E-mail:textroadjournals@gmail.com
http//: www.TextRoad.com

 

2016-11-09 10:46 GMT+03:00 U. Fitriati <ufitriati@unlam.ac.id>:
Dear Editor.
Greeting and Best wishes.

--
Ulfa Fitriati ST., M.Eng
19810922 2005012003
Program Studi Teknik Sipil/ Civil Engineering Department
Fakultas Teknik  Universitas Lambung Mangkurat/Lambung Mangkurat University
Jl. A. Yani Km. 35 Banjarbaru, Kalimantan Selatan, Indonesia

--
Ulfa Fitriati ST., M.Eng
19810922 2005012003
Program Studi Teknik Sipil/ Civil Engineering Department
Fakultas Teknik  Universitas Lambung Mangkurat/Lambung Mangkurat University
Jl. A. Yani Km. 35 Banjarbaru, Kalimantan Selatan, Indonesia
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