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Online submission email reply content
1 pesan

IAEME Publication <editor@iaeme.com> 7 Juli 2021 pukul 20.57
Balas Ke: editor@iaeme.com
Kepada: candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id, candrayuliana@ymail.com

Your Research article submitted Successfully
Hi Candra Yuliana

Thank You.. Your Article is Submitted Successfully...!

Article Title : STRATEGIES TO OVERCOME TIME DELAYS FOR IMPLEMENTATION OF ROAD
PROJECTS IN SWAMPY LAND
Journal Name : INTERNATIONAL JOURNAL OF CIVIL ENGINEERING AND TECHNOLOGY
Your Paper Submission id : 00254
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Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id>

Paper Acceptance Notification - IJCIET/12/07/2021/IJCIET_54876
5 pesan

Chief Editor, IAEME Publication- Scopus Journals <editor@iaeme.com> 7 Juli 2021 pukul 21.38
Kepada: candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id

Dear Candra Yuliana, Retna Hapsari Kartadipura, Retno Tri Pamungkas,
 
We would like to inform you that your paper titled “STRATEGIES TO OVERCOME TIME DELAYS
FOR IMPLEMENTATION OF ROAD PROJECTS IN SWAMPY LAND” has been accepted for
publication in International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET), Volume
12, Issue 07, (July 2021) issue of the journal based on the Recommendation of the Editorial
Board without any major corrections in the content submitted by the researcher.
This letter is the official confirmation of acceptance of your research paper.
 
Your research work is licensed under a Creative Commons Attribution 4.0 (International)
License. (CC BY-NC 4.0). Hence no need to submit the Copyright form.
 
Your research paper will be appearing in IJCIET, Volume 12, Issue 7, July 2021.

International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET) -Scope Database
Indexed

Scope Database Source ID: https://scopedatabase.com/Sourceid/00000001
ISSN Print: 0976 – 6308 / ISSN Online: 0976 - 6316

Review Comments are attached along with the mail.
 
Kindly send the Publication fee of $ 300 (Online only). The Online Only mode includes
online publication of paper, indexing of paper in more than 20 search engines and soft copy
of the publication certificate.
 
You can transfer the money and send the scan copy of payment made evidence through e-
mail.
 
Account Details
 
Account Number 920020051233078
Name of the Account IAEME Publication
Bank Axis Bank
Branch Thiruvanmiyur, Chennai
Type of Account Current
Swift Code AXISINBB423
IFSC CODE UTIB0000423

 
Kindly acknowledge the Paper acceptance. Thanks and looking to receive the payment from
your side at the earliest
 
Thank you.
 
Yours Sincerely,

https://scopedatabase.com/Sourceid/00000001
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Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication
E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com, editor@iaeme.com
Website: www.iaeme.com

Follow us on
https://www.facebook.com/iaemepublication
https://twitter.com/IaemeEditor
https://www.linkedin.com/in/iaeme-publication
https://iaemepublication.wordpress.com/
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UC5LDnvevfv6swjDmTDh_aqQ

Disclaimer: The entire content of this email message is confidential. This also applies to any files
attached to it. This email is intended for an individual or entity to whom they are addressed. In case
you are not the addressee of this email, and you have received it in error, immediately contact the
system manager. The information in this email is very sensitive, and it is intended for the specific
addressee. This email should not be disseminated, distributed or copied. If you have received this
email and it was not for you, make sure to immediately notify the sender by email and afterwards
delete this email from your system. Disclosing, copying, distributing, or taking any action in
reliance on the email content is strictly prohibited.

2 lampiran

IJCIET_12_07_54876_Review-Report.pdf
146K

IJCIET_12_07_54876_Acceptance-Letter.pdf
167K

Chief Editor, IAEME Publication- Scopus Journals <editor@iaeme.com> 13 Juli 2021 pukul 11.28
Kepada: Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id>

Dear Candra
ok. Accepted your request. Pay only $ 250 US Dollar.
Thanks

On Tue, Jul 13, 2021 at 6:28 AM Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id> wrote:
Dear   Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication

Thank you for your information about my paper.
Can you lower the publication fee for me, maybe $ 250.
I am interested in IJCIET journals through recommendations from my friends,
Darmansyah Tjitradi, which his paper has been published in International Journal of Civil
Engineering and Technology (IJCIET), https://iaeme.com/Home/issue/IJCIET?
Volume=12&Issue=6
Darmansyah paper publication fee $ 250

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]
--
Candra Yuliana, S.T., M.T.
Engineering Faculty - Universitas Lambung Mangkurat
Jl. Brigjend. Hasan Basri BANJARMASIN 70123 - INDONESIA
Tel./Fax. : (0511) 4773858
Mobile Phone : +62 812 500 18822
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--
[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id> 14 Juli 2021 pukul 08.34
Kepada: henny.anggraieni@bni.co.id

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

2 lampiran

IJCIET_12_07_54876_Review-Report.pdf
146K

IJCIET_12_07_54876_Acceptance-Letter.pdf
167K

Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id> 14 Juli 2021 pukul 08.39
Kepada: lolita.winarti@bni.co.id

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

2 lampiran

IJCIET_12_07_54876_Review-Report.pdf
146K

IJCIET_12_07_54876_Acceptance-Letter.pdf
167K

Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id> 14 Juli 2021 pukul 09.43
Kepada: "Chief Editor, IAEME Publication- Scopus Journals" <editor@iaeme.com>

Dear   Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication

Here I attach the the 
scan copy of 
payment of my paper 
(paper ID: 
IJCIET/12/07/2021/IJ
CIET_54876)

[Kutipan teks disembunyikan]

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ui=2&ik=d2c71fc4e3&view=att&th=17aa270220caf36b&attid=0.1&disp=attd&realattid=f_kqtj0f6x0&safe=1&zw
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Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id>

Received the payment made evidence
1 pesan

Chief Editor, IAEME Publication- Scopus Journals <editor@iaeme.com> 14 Juli 2021 pukul 11.41
Kepada: Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id>

Dear Sir/Madam
 

Received the payment made evidence. Normally all foreign transaction will
take 2 to 4 days time period to credit the money into our account. After
receiving the money, paper will be published in online. We will inform the
status of the paper
Thanks
On Wed, Jul 14, 2021 at 7:13 AM Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id> wrote:

Dear   Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication

Here I attach the the 
scan copy of 
payment of my paper 
(paper ID: 
IJCIET/12/07/2021/IJ
CIET_54876)

Pada tanggal Sel, 13 Jul 2021 pukul 11.28 Chief Editor, IAEME Publication- Scopus Journals <editor@iaeme.com>
menulis:

Dear Candra
ok. Accepted your request. Pay only $ 250 US Dollar.
Thanks

On Tue, Jul 13, 2021 at 6:28 AM Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id> wrote:
Dear   Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication

Thank you for your information about my paper.
Can you lower the publication fee for me, maybe $ 250.

mailto:candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id
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I am interested in IJCIET journals through recommendations from my friends,
Darmansyah Tjitradi, which his paper has been published in International Journal of Civil
Engineering and Technology (IJCIET), https://iaeme.com/Home/issue/IJCIET?
Volume=12&Issue=6
Darmansyah paper publication fee $ 250

Pada tanggal Rab, 7 Jul 2021 pukul 21.38 Chief Editor, IAEME Publication- Scopus Journals
<editor@iaeme.com> menulis:

Dear Candra Yuliana, Retna Hapsari Kartadipura, Retno Tri Pamungkas,
 
We would like to inform you that your paper titled “STRATEGIES TO OVERCOME TIME
DELAYS FOR IMPLEMENTATION OF ROAD PROJECTS IN SWAMPY LAND” has been
accepted for publication in International Journal of Civil Engineering and
Technology (IJCIET), Volume 12, Issue 07, (July 2021) issue of the journal based on
the Recommendation of the Editorial Board without any major corrections in the
content submitted by the researcher.
This letter is the official confirmation of acceptance of your research paper.
 
Your research work is licensed under a Creative Commons Attribution 4.0
(International) License. (CC BY-NC 4.0). Hence no need to submit the Copyright
form.
 
Your research paper will be appearing in IJCIET, Volume 12, Issue 7, July 2021.

International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET) -Scope Database
Indexed

Scope Database Source ID: https://scopedatabase.com/Sourceid/00000001
ISSN Print: 0976 – 6308 / ISSN Online: 0976 - 6316

Review Comments are attached along with the mail.
 
Kindly send the Publication fee of $ 300 (Online only). The Online Only mode
includes online publication of paper, indexing of paper in more than 20 search engines
and soft copy of the publication certificate.
 
You can transfer the money and send the scan copy of payment made evidence
through e-mail.
 
Account Details
 
Account Number 920020051233078
Name of the Account IAEME Publication
Bank Axis Bank
Branch Thiruvanmiyur, Chennai
Type of Account Current
Swift Code AXISINBB423
IFSC CODE UTIB0000423

 
Kindly acknowledge the Paper acceptance. Thanks and looking to receive the payment
from your side at the earliest
 
Thank you.
 
Yours Sincerely,

https://iaeme.com/Home/issue/IJCIET?Volume=12&Issue=6
mailto:editor@iaeme.com
https://scopedatabase.com/Sourceid/00000001
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Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication
E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com, editor@iaeme.com
Website: www.iaeme.com

Follow us on
https://www.facebook.com/iaemepublication
https://twitter.com/IaemeEditor
https://www.linkedin.com/in/iaeme-publication
https://iaemepublication.wordpress.com/
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UC5LDnvevfv6swjDmTDh_aqQ

Disclaimer: The entire content of this email message is confidential. This also applies to any
files attached to it. This email is intended for an individual or entity to whom they are
addressed. In case you are not the addressee of this email, and you have received it in error,
immediately contact the system manager. The information in this email is very sensitive, and
it is intended for the specific addressee. This email should not be disseminated, distributed
or copied. If you have received this email and it was not for you, make sure to immediately
notify the sender by email and afterwards delete this email from your system. Disclosing,
copying, distributing, or taking any action in reliance on the email content is strictly
prohibited.

--
Candra Yuliana, S.T., M.T.
Engineering Faculty - Universitas Lambung Mangkurat
Jl. Brigjend. Hasan Basri BANJARMASIN 70123 - INDONESIA
Tel./Fax. : (0511) 4773858
Mobile Phone : +62 812 500 18822

--

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication
E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com, editor@iaeme.com
Website: www.iaeme.com

Follow us on
https://www.facebook.com/iaemepublication
https://twitter.com/IaemeEditor
https://www.linkedin.com/in/iaeme-publication
https://iaemepublication.wordpress.com/
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UC5LDnvevfv6swjDmTDh_aqQ

Disclaimer: The entire content of this email message is confidential. This also applies to any
files attached to it. This email is intended for an individual or entity to whom they are
addressed. In case you are not the addressee of this email, and you have received it in error,
immediately contact the system manager. The information in this email is very sensitive, and it is
intended for the specific addressee. This email should not be disseminated, distributed or copied.
If you have received this email and it was not for you, make sure to immediately notify the sender
by email and afterwards delete this email from your system. Disclosing, copying, distributing, or
taking any action in reliance on the email content is strictly prohibited.

--
Candra Yuliana, S.T., M.T.
Engineering Faculty - Universitas Lambung Mangkurat
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Jl. Brigjend. Hasan Basri BANJARMASIN 70123 - INDONESIA
Tel./Fax. : (0511) 4773858
Mobile Phone : +62 812 500 18822

--

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication
E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com, editor@iaeme.com
Website: www.iaeme.com

Follow us on
https://www.facebook.com/iaemepublication
https://twitter.com/IaemeEditor
https://www.linkedin.com/in/iaeme-publication
https://iaemepublication.wordpress.com/
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UC5LDnvevfv6swjDmTDh_aqQ

Disclaimer: The entire content of this email message is confidential. This also applies to any files
attached to it. This email is intended for an individual or entity to whom they are addressed. In case
you are not the addressee of this email, and you have received it in error, immediately contact the
system manager. The information in this email is very sensitive, and it is intended for the specific
addressee. This email should not be disseminated, distributed or copied. If you have received this
email and it was not for you, make sure to immediately notify the sender by email and afterwards
delete this email from your system. Disclosing, copying, distributing, or taking any action in
reliance on the email content is strictly prohibited.
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Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id>

Received the publication fee
2 pesan

Chief Editor, IAEME Publication- Scopus Journals <editor@iaeme.com> 14 Juli 2021 pukul 13.17
Kepada: Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id>

Dear Sir/Madam                                    
Received the publication fee. Within 2 days’ time period, paper/article will be
published in the journal in online and you will get the email from our editing
Department for the same. Thanks for your prompt response

On Wed, Jul 14, 2021 at 9:11 AM Chief Editor, IAEME Publication- Scopus Journals <editor@iaeme.com> wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam

 
Received the payment made evidence. Normally all foreign transaction will
take 2 to 4 days time period to credit the money into our account. After
receiving the money, paper will be published in online. We will inform the
status of the paper
Thanks
On Wed, Jul 14, 2021 at 7:13 AM Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id> wrote:

Dear   Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication

Here I attach the the 
scan copy of 
payment of my paper 
(paper ID: 
IJCIET/12/07/2021/IJ
CIET_54876)

Pada tanggal Sel, 13 Jul 2021 pukul 11.28 Chief Editor, IAEME Publication- Scopus Journals
<editor@iaeme.com> menulis:

Dear Candra
ok. Accepted your request. Pay only $ 250 US Dollar.
Thanks

mailto:editor@iaeme.com
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mailto:editor@iaeme.com
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On Tue, Jul 13, 2021 at 6:28 AM Candra Yuliana <candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id> wrote:
Dear   Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication

Thank you for your information about my paper.
Can you lower the publication fee for me, maybe $ 250.
I am interested in IJCIET journals through recommendations from my friends,
Darmansyah Tjitradi, which his paper has been published in International Journal of
Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET), https://iaeme.com/Home/issue/IJCIET?
Volume=12&Issue=6
Darmansyah paper publication fee $ 250

Pada tanggal Rab, 7 Jul 2021 pukul 21.38 Chief Editor, IAEME Publication- Scopus Journals
<editor@iaeme.com> menulis:

Dear Candra Yuliana, Retna Hapsari Kartadipura, Retno Tri Pamungkas,
 
We would like to inform you that your paper titled “STRATEGIES TO OVERCOME
TIME DELAYS FOR IMPLEMENTATION OF ROAD PROJECTS IN SWAMPY LAND” has
been accepted for publication in International Journal of Civil Engineering and
Technology (IJCIET), Volume 12, Issue 07, (July 2021) issue of the journal based on
the Recommendation of the Editorial Board without any major corrections in the
content submitted by the researcher.
This letter is the official confirmation of acceptance of your research paper.
 
Your research work is licensed under a Creative Commons Attribution 4.0
(International) License. (CC BY-NC 4.0). Hence no need to submit the Copyright
form.
 
Your research paper will be appearing in IJCIET, Volume 12, Issue 7, July 2021.

International Journal of Civil Engineering and Technology (IJCIET) -Scope
Database Indexed

Scope Database Source ID: https://scopedatabase.com/Sourceid/00000001
ISSN Print: 0976 – 6308 / ISSN Online: 0976 - 6316

Review Comments are attached along with the mail.
 
Kindly send the Publication fee of $ 300 (Online only). The Online Only mode
includes online publication of paper, indexing of paper in more than 20 search
engines and soft copy of the publication certificate.
 
You can transfer the money and send the scan copy of payment made evidence
through e-mail.
 
Account Details
 
Account Number 920020051233078
Name of the Account IAEME Publication
Bank Axis Bank
Branch Thiruvanmiyur, Chennai
Type of Account Current
Swift Code AXISINBB423

mailto:candrayuliana@ulm.ac.id
https://iaeme.com/Home/issue/IJCIET?Volume=12&Issue=6
mailto:editor@iaeme.com
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IFSC CODE UTIB0000423
 
Kindly acknowledge the Paper acceptance. Thanks and looking to receive the
payment from your side at the earliest
 
Thank you.
 
Yours Sincerely,

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication
E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com, editor@iaeme.com
Website: www.iaeme.com

Follow us on
https://www.facebook.com/iaemepublication
https://twitter.com/IaemeEditor
https://www.linkedin.com/in/iaeme-publication
https://iaemepublication.wordpress.com/
https://www.youtube.com/channel/UC5LDnvevfv6swjDmTDh_aqQ

Disclaimer: The entire content of this email message is confidential. This also applies to
any files attached to it. This email is intended for an individual or entity to whom they
are addressed. In case you are not the addressee of this email, and you have received it in
error, immediately contact the system manager. The information in this email is very
sensitive, and it is intended for the specific addressee. This email should not be
disseminated, distributed or copied. If you have received this email and it was not for you,
make sure to immediately notify the sender by email and afterwards delete this email from
your system. Disclosing, copying, distributing, or taking any action in reliance on the
email content is strictly prohibited.

--
Candra Yuliana, S.T., M.T.
Engineering Faculty - Universitas Lambung Mangkurat
Jl. Brigjend. Hasan Basri BANJARMASIN 70123 - INDONESIA
Tel./Fax. : (0511) 4773858
Mobile Phone : +62 812 500 18822

--

Prof. Dr. S. Balasubramanian, Ph.D, DSc
Chief Editor
IAEME Publication
E-mail: iaemedu@gmail.com, editor@iaeme.com
Website: www.iaeme.com

Follow us on
https://www.facebook.com/iaemepublication
https://twitter.com/IaemeEditor
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