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AN | AMBUNG MANGKURAT Iryantl Fatyasarl Nata <Ifnata@ulm.ac.|d>

Chairul Irawan <cirawan@ulm.ac.id> Tue, Aug 24, 2021 at 8:35 AM

To: Iryanti Nata <ifnata@ulm.ac.id>

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Rahmat Hidayat <rahmat@insightsociety.org>
Date: Tue, Aug 24, 2021, 08:28

Subject: [IJASEIT] Revision Required

To: Dr. CHAIRUL - IRAWAN <cirawan@ulm.ac.id>

Dr. CHAIRUL - IRAWAN:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to International
Journal on Advanced Science, Engineering and Information Technology, "Palm
Qil Shell Pyrolysis: Temperature Effect, Kinetics, and Thermodynamics

Study".

Our decision is to: Revision Required

Please update your abstract into 220-250 words and References should use at
least 20 references, with reference 70% in (2018-2021) from
journal/conference indexed by Scopus. Citation and Reference in Paper must
using Mendeley with IEEE Style.

Please submit your revision (Template IJASEIT 2021) in 10 days. More than 10
days of paper will be rejected from the system. Re-upload your revision into
journal system NOT via email.

Editor

International Journal on Advanced Science, Engineering and Information
Technology
http://insightsociety.org/ijaseit/index.php/ijaseit
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-1,

08 | AMBUNG MANGKURAT Iryanti Fatyasari Nata <ifnata@ulm.ac.id>

Rahmat Hidayat <mr.rahmat@gmail.com> Mon, Dec 13, 2021 at 2:34 PM

Reply-To: mr.rahmat@gmail.com
To: ifnata@ulm.ac.id

RE: JOURNAL PROCESSING FEE

We are happy to inform you that since Volume 5
(2015) International Journal on Advanced Science, Engineering,
Information and Technology (IJASEIT) has been indexed
in Scopus. The Scientific committees of IJASEIT agree that your
manuscript is accepted to be published in IJASEIT.

Tittle Palm Qil Shell Pyrolysis: Temperature Effect, Kinetics,
and Thermodynamics Study

Rinny Jelita, Jefriadia, Chairul Irawan, Meilana Dharma
Authors Putra, Muhammad Hafiz, Indrayati Angreini and Iryanti
Fatyasari Nata

Journal Processing Fee: USD $ 255 + Proofread Paper USD

$ 125, Total USD $ 380. Indonesian authors: 5.500.000 IDR per
article.

Please complete the payment of journal processing fee through
wire transfer to:

Account Name : Rahmat Hidayat
BANK Name : Bank Negara Indonesia (BNI)
Account No : 00597 62722
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if the payment complete, please reply with copy of Bank
transfer to this E-mail or via WhatApps to +62821 71
822448

Best Regards

Rahmat Hidayat

Editor in Chief

International Journal on Advanced Science, Engineering and Information
Technology (IJASEIT)

ISSN: 2088-5334 / e-ISSN: 2460-6952 / DOI: 10.18517

2017 SCIimago Journal Rank (SJR): 0.242

2018 SCImago Journal Rank (SJR): 0.230
2019 SCImago Journal Rank (SJR): 0.274
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Iryanti Fatyasari Nata <ifnata@ulm.ac.id>

To: mr.rahmat@gmail.com

Thank you for your information,..

May I have information about the time of publication for this manuscript? in

2021 or 2022.

If possible, the manuscript can be published in 2022.
I will complete the journal processing fee as soon as possible.

Thank you
[Quoted text hidden]

Best Regards,

Iryanti Fatyasari Nata
Professor

Chemical Engineering Department

Faculty of Engineering, Lambung Mangkurat University

J1. A. Yani Km. 34, Banjarbaru
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