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[Fwd: [JT] Editor Decision]

Dari: renanto@chem-eng.its.ac.id
Kepada: agusmirwan@yahoo.com

Tanggal: Rabu, 16 Agustus 2017 00.48 WITA

Dear Agus,

please make a revision according to the reviewers from Jurnal Teknologi
UTM as soon as possible. Let me know immediately after you make a
revision. Thank you.

Pak Re.

Original Message
Subject: [JT] Editor Decision

From: "Professor Dr. Rosli Md lllias" <r-rosli@utm.my>

Date: Tue, August 15, 2017 5:39 pm

To:  "Prof Renanto Handogo" <renanto@chem-eng.its.ac.id>
Cc: journal_utm@utm.my

Prof Renanto Handogo:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Jurnal Teknologi,
"KINETIC MODEL FOR IDENTIFYING THE RATE CONTROLLING STEP OF THE ALUMINUM
LEACHING FROM PEAT CLAY".

Our decision is to: REVISION REQUIRED

2. Reviewers have now commented on your paper. You will see that they are
advising you to revise your manuscript. If you are prepared to undertake the
work required, | would be pleased to consider your article for publication.

3. For your guidance, reviewers' comments are attached.

4. Please be advised all articles that have been chosen to be published in
Jurnal Teknologi will be charged 318.00 including 6% GST. If you agree to

this term, please;

a) Submit the revised version within 3 weeks through the system AND

b) Submit through email journal_utm@utm.my /gpenerbit@utm.my

¢) YOU SHOULD ALSO ATTACH THE LIST OF CORRECTIONS BEING DONE.

5. For payment purposes, please fill in the document "JT Invoice Request and
Payment Instructions NORMAL ISSUE" attached to enable us prepare a formal
invoice. Please email this document to journal_utm@utm.my /gpenerbit@utm.my
after you have resubmit your article.

THANK YOU.

Professor Dr. Rosli Md lllias
Universiti Teknologi Malaysia
r-rosli@utm.my

Jurnal Teknologi, Penerbit UTM Press
http://www.jurnalteknologi.utm.my/

Institut Teknologi Sepuluh Nopember (ITS)
http://www.its.ac.id
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Bls: [Fwd: [JT] Editor Decision]

Dari: agus mirwan (agusmirwan@yahoo.com)
Kepada: renanto@chem-eng.its.ac.id; rhandogo2@gmail.com
Cc agusmirwan@unlam.ac.id

Tanggal: Senin, 28 Agustus 2017 10.23 WITA

Bapak Prof. Renanto Yang saya hormati,

Berikut ini saya kirimkan file artikel Jurnal Teknologi UTM Malaysia yang sudah diperbaiki dan file jawaban dari hasil review
nya.

Kedua filenya dalam bentuk ms.word dengan nama file "JT_Agus Mirwan - revised 28-08-2017" dan "1st Answer of
reviewers' comments_JT UTM_28-08-2017".

Semoga filenya dapat Bapak terima dengan baik

Saya mengucapkan terima kasih atas perhatian dari Bapak.

Hormat saya,
Agus Mirwan

Pada Selasa, 15 Agustus 2017 23:48, "renanto@chem-eng.its.ac.id" <renanto@chem-eng.its.ac.id> menulis:

Dear Agus,

please make a revision according to the reviewers from Jurnal Teknologi
UTM as soon as possible. Let me know immediately after you make a
revision. Thank you.

Pak Re.

Original Message
Subject: [JT] Editor Decision

From: "Professor Dr. Rosli Md lllias" <r-rosli@utm.my>

Date: Tue, August 15, 2017 5:39 pm

To:  "Prof Renanto Handogo" <renanto@chem-eng.its.ac.id>
Cc:  journal_utm@utm.my

Prof Renanto Handogo:

We have reached a decision regarding your submission to Jurnal Teknologi,

"KINETIC MODEL FOR IDENTIFYING THE RATE CONTROLLING STEP OF THE ALUMINUM
LEACHING FROM PEAT CLAY™".

Our decision is to: REVISION REQUIRED

2. Reviewers have now commented on your paper. You will see that they are

advising you to revise your manuscript. If you are prepared to undertake the

work required, | would be pleased to consider your article for publication.

3. For your guidance, reviewers' comments are attached.

4. Please be advised all articles that have been chosen to be published in
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Jurnal Teknologi will be charged 318.00 including 6% GST. If you agree to

this term, please;

a) Submit the revised version within 3 weeks through the system AND

b) Submit through email journal_utm@utm.my /gpenerbit@utm.my

c) YOU SHOULD ALSO ATTACH THE LIST OF CORRECTIONS BEING DONE.

5. For payment purposes, please fill in the document "JT Invoice Request and
Payment Instructions NORMAL ISSUE" attached to enable us prepare a formal
invoice. Please email this document to journal_utm@utm.my /gpenerbit@utm.my
after you have resubmit your article.

THANK YOU.

Professor Dr. Rosli Md lllias
Universiti Teknologi Malaysia
r-rosli@utm.my

Jurnal Teknologi, Penerbit UTM Press
http://www.jurnalteknologi.utm.my/

Institut Teknologi Sepuluh Nopember (ITS)
http://www.its.ac.id

JT_Agus Mirwan - revised 28-08-2017.docx
2.1MB

1st Answer of reviewers' comments_JT UTM_28-08-2017.docx
18kB
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JT_Agus Mirwan - revised 28-08-2017 dan 1st Answer of reviewers' comments_JT UTM_28-08-
2017

Dari: agus mirwan (agusmirwan@yahoo.com)
Kepada: renanto@chem-eng.its.ac.id; rhandogo2@gmail.com
Cc agusmirwan@unlam.ac.id

Tanggal: Rabu, 30 Agustus 2017 08.22 WITA

Bapak Prof. Renanto Yang saya hormati,

Berikut ini saya kirimkan lagi file artikel Jurnal Teknologi UTM Malaysia yang sudah diperbaiki dan file jawaban dari hasil
review nya.

Kedua filenya dalam bentuk ms.word dengan nama file "JT_Agus Mirwan - revised 28-08-2017" dan "1st Answer of
reviewers' comments_JT UTM_28-08-2017".

Semoga filenya dapat Bapak terima dengan baik

Saya mengucapkan terima kasih atas perhatian dari Bapak.

Hormat saya,
Agus Mirwan

@ JT_Agus Mirwan - revised 28-08-2017.docx
2.1MB

@ 1st Answer of reviewers' comments_JT UTM_28-08-2017.docx
18kB
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Re: Fwd: #10914: KINETIC MODEL FOR IDENTIFYING THE RATE CONTROLLING STEP OF THE
ALUMINUM LEACHING FROM PEAT CLAY

Dari:
Kepada:
Cc

Tanggal:

agus mirwan (agusmirwan@yahoo.com)
rhandogo2@gmail.com
agusmirwan@unlam.ac.id

Kamis, 14 September 2017 05.02 WITA

Prof. Renanto yang saya hormati,

Saya mengucapkan banyak terima kasih atas informasi dari Bapak.
Saya mohon maaf baru mengirimkan email balasan ke Bapak.
Sebagai informasi, InsyaaAllah nanti siang saya akan masuk lab.
Terima kasih atas perhatian dari Bapak.

Hormat saya,
Agus Mirwan

Pada Rabu, 13 September 2017 15.39.45 WIB, renanto <rhandogo2@gmail.com> menulis:

For your information, i will send the proof of payment to jurnal teknologi.

Pak Re.

Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: Journal UTM <journal_utm@utm.my>
Date: September 13, 2017 at 2:55:49 PM GMT+7
To: renanto@chem-eng.its.ac.id

Cc: Quality Penerbit Penerbit UTM <gpenerbit@utm.my>
Subject: #10914: KINETIC MODEL FOR IDENTIFYING THE RATE CONTROLLING STEP OF THE ALUMINUM
LEACHING FROM PEAT CLAY

--0012114268162de37f05590d7e9b
Content-Type: text/plain; charset="UTF-8"
Content-Transfer-Encoding: quoted-printable

Dear Professor/Dr./Sir/Madam,

Congratulations! Your article has been queued for future publication of
Jurnal Teknologi (Sciences and Engineering): Vol.
=E2=80=8B80=E2=80=8B

2 March 2018

. Attached herewith the invoice for your further action. Kindly email the

proof of payment to: journal_utm@utm.my or gpenerbit@utm.my before or by
=E2=80=8B15 November 2017
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