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to me  

 
 

---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) <ijb@innspub.net> 

Date: Wed, Nov 9, 2022 at 5:30 AM 

Subject: IJB-5245 

To: Muhammad Rizal <mrizal@ulm.ac.id> 

Dear Author, 

Thanks for the payment. Now your paper will be sent for editing and we will get back to 
you with the published version. Until then, please be patience! 

--- 

Sincerely, 

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia) 

Editor in Chief 

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) 

web: http://innspub.net  

http://facebook.com/innspub 

On 2022-11-08 17:22, Muhammad Rizal wrote: 

Dear Dr. Ahmad Kabir 
Editor in Chief 
International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) 

  
I send the money control for processing fee of our paper entitled "The Effect of 
Addition of Moringa Leaf Extract in Lactose Extender on Frozen Semen Quality of 
Boer Crossbreed Goat" (Muhammad Riyadhi et al). 
Thnks for your attention. 
  
Sincerely, 
Dr. Muhammad Rizal 
Department of Animal Science 
Lambung Mangkurat University 
mrizal@ulm.ac.id 
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On Mon, Nov 7, 2022 at 11:11 AM International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) 

<ijb@innspub.net> wrote: 

--  

Sincerely, 

Dr. Ahmad Kabir (PhD, Australia) 

Editor in Chief 

International Journal of Biosciences (IJB) 

web: http://innspub.net  

http://facebook.com/innspub 

 

Muhammad Rizal  
 

Dec 30, 2022, 9:19 PM (4 days ago) 
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