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Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re:
Transaction receipt

Dari: Dr. M.N. Khan (micro_drkhan@yahoo.com)

Kepada: arizali25@yahoo.com

Tanggal: Kamis, 26 November 2020 17.09 WIB

Dear Dr. Rizali, 

Your article is already published online under the "Article in Press" section ahead of the print
issue, you can check it here: https://microbiologyjournal.org/articles-in-press/

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Thursday, 26 November 2020, 06:23:00 am GMT+5:30, akhmad rizali <arizali25@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. M. N. Khan
As you promise before that today Nov. 26 my article will publish.
Hopely you could publish as soon as posible.

Thanks and regards,
Dr. Rizali

Dikirim dari Yahoo Mail di Android

Pada Kam, 19 Nov 2020 pada 19:36, Dr. M.N. Khan
<micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> menulis:

Dear Dr. Akhmad,

Thanks for confirming, your article will be published online by Nov. 26, 2020.

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Thursday, 19 November 2020, 01:57:23 pm GMT+5:30, akhmad rizali <arizali25@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. M. N. Khan
After I reviewed everything, starting from the Abstract, Introduction, Materials and Methods, Result and
Dicussion, and Conclusion. Then our paper is complete. 

Thanks and regard,

https://microbiologyjournal.org/articles-in-press/
https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature
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Dr. Rizali

Dikirim dari Yahoo Mail di Android

Pada Kam, 19 Nov 2020 pada 16:00, Dr. M.N. Khan
<micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> menulis:

Dr Rizali

Find final pdf, Kindly confirm.

Looking forward to your reply.

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Thursday, 19 November 2020, 11:20:04 am GMT+5:30, akhmad rizali <arizali25@yahoo.com>
wrote:

Dear  M. N. Khan
Sorry, one more that is still left. Treatment associated with endophyte B4b change to Jc4.

Thanks and regards,
Dr. Rizali

Dikirim dari Yahoo Mail di Android

Pada Rab, 18 Nov 2020 pada 20:49, Dr. M.N. Khan
<micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> menulis:

Dr Rizali,

Find pdf and confirm.

Looking forward to your reply.

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Wednesday, 18 November 2020, 04:55:05 pm GMT+5:30, akhmad rizali
<arizali25@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr.M.N. Khan
Before that I apologize, because I was not careful, there were still some typos regarding the
isolate code in the sentence, based on fig 2. The highest mycelium... A4A and D4B were
replaced with Jc4 and Jc14. And another sentence, the highest percentage yield resistor was
PB4b replaced with PJc 10. The the dominance of space that occur in PB4b is replaced with
PJc 10. I hope you don't mind helping me.

Thanks and regards,

https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature
https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature


17/12/22 09.24 Yahoo Mail - Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Balas: Re: Transaction receipt

about:blank 3/7

Dr. Rizali

Dikirim dari Yahoo Mail di Android

Pada Rab, 18 Nov 2020 pada 16:00, Dr. M.N. Khan
<micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> menulis:

Dr Akhmad,

Find corrected final pdf proof, Kindly confirm.

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Wednesday, 18 November 2020, 07:05:13 am GMT+5:30, akhmad rizali
<arizali25@yahoo.com> wrote:

Pada Selasa, 17 November 2020 21.34.18 GMT+8, Dr. M.N. Khan
<micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> menulis:

Dear Dr. Rizali,

Please provide New fig.3 after removing the Pop-up as values are
hidden underneath on the horizontal axis and also check and
correct the spelling of TREATMENT, kindly check the attachment
and send the new figure.

Looking forward to your reply.

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Tuesday, 17 November 2020, 06:14:37 pm GMT+5:30, akhmad rizali
<arizali25@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. M.N.Khan
It is already change to the correction figure, all everything is ok.

Thank you for you assistant and cooperation.
Best regards,
Dr. Rizali

Dikirim dari Yahoo Mail di Android

Pada Sel, 17 Nov 2020 pada 20:14, Dr. M.N. Khan
<micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> menulis:

https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature
https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature
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Dear Dr. Rizali,

Kindly find the updated proofread copy as per the new figures
provided by you. However, Please provide New fig.3 after
removing the Pop-up as values are hidden underneath on the
horizontal axis.

Looking forward to your reply.

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Tuesday, 17 November 2020, 05:26:56 pm GMT+5:30, akhmad rizali
<arizali25@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. M. N. Khan
This is the same as before, there are no corrective changes to the figures that I
emailed this morning. I'm confused why you don't use the correction figure that
was sent via email, according to your request.

Ones again I hope you check in your email, the correction figure. So that no
wasting time.

Thanks and Regards,
Dr. Rizali

Dikirim dari Yahoo Mail di Android

Pada Sel, 17 Nov 2020 pada 19:32, Dr. M.N. Khan
<micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> menulis:

Dr Rizali

Find final corrected pdf, Kindly confirm.

Looking forward to your reply.

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Tuesday, 17 November 2020, 07:23:07 am GMT+5:30, akhmad rizali
<arizali25@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. M.N.Khan
I send the figure 1, figure 2 and figure 3, already corrected.

Thank you very much for your assistant.

https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature
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Best regards,
Dr. Rizali

Dikirim dari Yahoo Mail di Android

Pada Sen, 16 Nov 2020 pada 18:42, Dr. M.N. Khan
<micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> menulis:

Dr Rizali

Find final article pdf, Kindly confirm.

Looking forward to your reply.

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Saturday, 14 November 2020, 01:16:53 pm GMT+5:30, Dr. M.N.
Khan <micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. Rizali,

Thanks for your email, we will send you the corrected
draft copy for proofreading by Tuesday i.e. Nov. 17,
2020.

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Friday, 13 November 2020, 08:47:30 am GMT+5:30, akhmad
rizali <arizali25@yahoo.com> wrote:

Proof reading wih sticky note

Pada Kamis, 12 November 2020 17.08.59 GMT+8, Dr. M.N. Khan
<micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> menulis:

Dear Dr. Rizali,

Kindly send corrections in the proofread copy as sticky
notes, else it is very difficult for us to track
changes. Kindly send it at the earliest on this email
address only.

https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature
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Looking forward to your reply.

Thanks and Regards
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Wednesday, 11 November 2020, 09:18:26 am GMT+5:30,
akhmad rizali <arizali25@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. M. N. Khan

I would like to inform you that I have sent the article with the
correction. Did you receive it. Hopely my article will publish as soon
as.

Thank you for your attention and cooperation.

Best Regard,
Dr. Rizali

Dikirim dari Yahoo Mail di Android

Pada Rab, 7 Okt 2020 pada 16:22, Dr. M.N. Khan
<micro_drkhan@yahoo.com> menulis:

Dear Dr Rizali

We have received the publication charges and
soon we send you the article for proof-reading.

Regards 

 
Dr. M.N. Khan
Editor
+91-9893809167
www.microbiologyjournal.org

On Wednesday, 7 October 2020, 08:03:34 am GMT+5:30,
akhmad rizali <arizali25@yahoo.com> wrote:

Dear Dr. M. N. Khan

I would like to inform you that I paid and I share the
transaction receipt.

Thank you for your attention

Best Regards,
Dr. Akhmad Rizali

https://go.onelink.me/107872968?pid=InProduct&c=Global_Internal_YGrowth_AndroidEmailSig__AndroidUsers&af_wl=ym&af_sub1=Internal&af_sub2=Global_YGrowth&af_sub3=EmailSignature
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